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Thank you for your Freedom of Information request.  
 
1. In the most recent 12 months of data which you have access to, how many patients have been 
diagnosed with the following stages of prostate cancer: 

A. Stage 1 and stage 2 - localised prostate cancer 
B. Stage 3 cancer that has not spread to other parts of the body - locally advanced prostate cancer 
C. Stage 4 cancer which has spread to other parts of the body - metastatic prostate cancer. 

2. In reference to the answer for question 1: 
A. what number, for each stage, received novel imaging? 
B. what was the average, for each stage, time post diagnosis for them to receive the novel imaging? 

3. In the most recent 12 months of data which you have access to, how many patients in total initially sat 
within the urology department, but were referred to the oncology department before they develop 
metastases? 
4. In reference to the answer for question 3, what number of these patients developed metastases prior 
to being referred to the oncology department? 
5. For all patients who have received darolutamide, what is the average duration of treatment? 
 
I have considered your request and have set out the Trust’s response below: 
 
1. 

Count of Patient 
ID Column Labels 

Stages I II III IV (blank) Grand Total 
Grand Total 19 89 31 16 73 228 

Please note, the Blank figures relates to patients who have been diagnosed for prostate cancer, but their 
stage has not been recorded / not identified when this data was collect.  
 
2-4. 
The information that you have requested is not held in a form that would enable it to be located, 
retrieved and extracted within the appropriate time limit that equates to 18 hours as defined by the 
Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limits and Fees) Regulations 2004. 
 
We do not record this information in separate formats. So to collect all of this data, we would need to 
search each individual file of our patients, which would be for 228 patients and to check each file to 
collect this information would take roughly 15mins per file.  
 
Based on 228 files needing to be searched, and the search taking approximately 15mins per file, this 
would take approximately 57 hours to complete. Where the appropriate limit is exceeded the Trust is 
not required to supply the information as per Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  
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5. 
I am writing to advise you that following a search of our paper and electronic files and records, the 
information you requested is not held by us. Oncology treatment that is supply for cancer patients in 
Herefordshire are provided by the Gloucester Hospitals Trust, so the information they supply for this 
will include patients from Herefordshire. 
 
Therefore there is no recorded information held to answer this under the Freedom of Information Act 
2000.  
 
Please note that a record of previous Trust FOI responses is now available to consult online by visiting:  
 
https://www.wyevalley.nhs.uk/about-us/information-requests/freedom-of-information-requests.aspx  
 
If you have queries or any concerns my contact details are given at the top of the letter. Please remember to quote 
the reference number above in any future communications. If you are dissatisfied with the handling or response to 
your request and wish to ask for a review of this, please contact me and I will arrange this to be done. 
 
Further information is available from the Information Commissioner’s Office who can be contacted at:  
 
Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF 
Telephone: 0303 123 1113 Web site:  www.ico.gov.uk 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 
Freedom of Information Coordinator 
 
Re-Use of Public Sector Information 
All information supplied by the Trust in answering a request for information (RFI) under the Freedom of 
Information Act 2000 will be subject to the terms of the Re-use of Public Sector Information Regulations 2005, 
Statutory Instrument 2005 No. 1515 which came into effect on 1st July 2005. 
 
Under the terms of the Regulations, the Trust will licence the re-use of any or all information supplied if being used in a form 
and for the purpose other than which it was originally supplied. This license for re-use will be in line with the requirements of 
the Regulations and the licensing terms and fees as laid down by the Office of Public Sector Information (OPSI). Most licenses 
will be free; however the Trust reserves the right, in certain circumstances to charge a fee for the re-use of some information 
which it deems to be of commercial value. 
 
Further information can be found at www.opsi.gov.uk where a sample license terms and fees can be found with guidance on 
copyright and publishing notes and a Guide to Best Practice and regulated advice and case studies, at 
www.opsi.gov.uk/advice/psi-regulations/index.htm 
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