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Thank you for your Freedom of Information request.

This is a request for information that relates to the organisation’s contracts around ICT contract(s)
for Server Hardware Maintenance, Server Virtualisation Licenses and Maintenance and Storage Area
Network (SAN) Maintenance/Support, which may include:

- Server Hardware Maintenance- contracts relating to the support and maintenance of the organisation’s
physical servers.

- Virtualisation Maintenance/Support/ Licensing (VMware, Solaris, Unix, Linux, Windows Server)

- Storage Area Network Maintenance/Support (EMC, NetApp etc)

For each of the types of contract described above, please can you provide me with the following data. If
there is more than one contract please split the information for each separate supplier this includes annual
spend

1. Contract Title: Please provide me with the contract title.
2. Type of Contracts (ABOVE): Please can you provide me with one or more contract types the contract
relates to: Server Hardware, Virtualisation, SAN (Storage Area Network)
3. Existing/Current Supplier: Please provide me with the supplier name for each contract.
4. Brand: Please state the brand of hardware or software
5. Operating System / Software (Platform): (Windows, Linux, Unix, Vsphere, AlX, Solaris etc.) Please state
the operating system used by the organisation.
6. Annual Average Spend: Please provide me with the most recent annual spend for this contract?
7. Contract Duration: (Please can you also include notes if the contract includes any contract Extension
periods.)

8. Contract Expiry Date: Please can you provide me with the date of when the contract expires.

9. Contract Review Date: (An approximate date of when the organisation is planning to review this
particular contract.)

10. Purchase of Servers: Could you please provide me with the month and year in which most/bulk of
servers were purchased.

11. Number of Physical Server: Please can you provide me with the number of physical servers.

12. Number of Virtual Servers: Please can you provide me with the number of Virtual servers

13. Brief Contract Description: | require a brief description of the service provided under this contract.
Please do not just put maintenance. | need at least a sentence.

14.Contract Owner: (The person from within the organisation that is responsible for reviewing and
renewing this particular contract. Please include their full name, job title, direct contact number and direct
email address.)

Glen Burley, Chief Executive Russell Hardy, Chairman
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| have considered your request and have set out the Trust’s response below:

| am writing to advise you that following a search of our paper and electronic files and records, the information you
requested is not held by us.

Our IT services are run by a third party company called Hoople Ltd, a public sector owned company part owned by
the Trust. Hoople Ltd provide IT services to a number of public authorities alongside the WVT, and in this case the
information is not held solely on behalf of the Trust and instead covers other stakeholder organisations as well.

If you wish to make a request under the Freedom of information Act 2000 direct to Hoople Ltd for the information
that they hold that would cover single solutions in place for all stakeholders, contact details are available via the
Hoople Ltd web site.

Therefore there is no recorded information held to answer this under the Freedom of Information Act 2000.

Yours sincerely,
Freedom of Information Coordinator

Please note that a record of previous Trust FOI responses is now available to consult online by visiting:
https://www.wyevalley.nhs.uk/about-us/information-requests/freedom-of-information-requests.aspx

If you have queries or any concerns my contact details Further information is available from the Information
are given at the top of the letter. Please remember to Commissioner’s Office who can be contacted at:
guote the reference number above in any future

communications. If you are dissatisfied with the Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House,
handling or response to your request and wish to ask Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF

for a review of this, please contact me and | will Telephone: 0303 123 1113

arrange this to be done. Web site: www.ico.gov.uk

Re-Use of Public Sector Information

All information supplied by the Trust in answering a request for information (RFI) under the Freedom of
Information Act 2000 will be subject to the terms of the Re-use of Public Sector Information Regulations 2005,
Statutory Instrument 2005 No. 1515 which came into effect on 1st July 2005.

Under the terms of the Regulations, the Trust will licence the re-use of any or all information supplied if being used in a form
and for the purpose other than which it was originally supplied. This license for re-use will be in line with the requirements of
the Regulations and the licensing terms and fees as laid down by the Office of Public Sector Information (OPSI). Most licenses
will be free; however the Trust reserves the right, in certain circumstances to charge a fee for the re-use of some information
which it deems to be of commercial value.

Further information can be found at www.opsi.gov.uk where a sample license terms and fees can be found with guidance on

copyright and publishing notes and a Guide to Best Practice and regulated advice and case studies, at
www.opsi.gov.uk/advice/psi-regulations/index.htm

Glen Burley, Chief Executive Russell Hardy, Chairman
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